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Temperatures across
Kashmir are expected to
come down slightly by a few
degrees from Saturday
onwards, offering some relief
from the prevailing heat-
wave.However, the tempera-
tures may remain a few
degrees above the seasonal
average, according to an
independent weather observ-
er, Kashmir Weather. He said
the forecast up to June 15
indicates predominantly dry
weather conditions across

most parts of the region,
although a few isolated areas
may experience thunder-
showers. Between June 16
and 17, the weather is likely
to remain mostly dry, with a
possibility of a rain spell or
thundershower activity in
some areas, particularly in
the Jammu region, which has
been witnessing intense heat
in recent weeks. From June
18 to 19, dry weather is again
expected to dominate,
although a brief shower can-
not be ruled out in one or two
locations.

Meanwhile, dry and hot
weather conditions persisted
across the Kashmir Valley on
Friday, although there was a
slight dip in temperatures
compared to the previous
day. According to the
Meteorological Centre
Srinagar, Srinagar recorded a
maximum temperature of
32.4°C, which is 4.4°C above
normal. This comes a day
after the summer capital reg-
istered a scorching 34.2°C on
Thursday - an increase by
6.2°C above normal.
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Farooq Abdullah 
urges MEA to ensure safety 

of Kashmiri students in Iran
SRINAGAR, JUN 13:

National Conference presi-
dent Farooq Abdullah on
Friday urged the Ministry of
External Affairs to ensure the
safety of Kashmiri students
in Iran, which was attacked
by Israel. Israel carried out
strikes early Friday that took
out top military officers and
hit nuclear and missile sites
in Iran, raising the potential 
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Temperatures across Kashmir expected
to come down slightly from Saturday

JAMMU BULLETIN BUREAU
SRINAGAR, JUN 13:

Chief Minister Omar
Abdullah today held a public
outreach programme at his
Raabita office in Srinagar,
where he listened to a wide
range of issues and demands
raised by individuals and del-
egations from across Jammu
and Kashmir.Director of IIT
Jammu, Manoj S. Gaur,
called for support to the
Venture Fund created by IIT

Jammu aimed at promoting
socio-economic development
in the region.A delegation of
the Kashmiri Language
Union raised concerns
regarding the promotion of
the Kashmiri language, urg-
ing greater institutional sup-
port for its development.

A delegation of Revenue
Officers submitted a memo-
randum seeking the reorgani-
zation of the Revenue 
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Scores of sadhus have
begun arriving in Jammu, the
city of temples, for their
onward pilgrimage to the
cave shrine of Amarnath in
the South Kashmir himalayas
beginning July 3.The 32-day
pilgrimage will commence
from the twin tracks, the tra-
ditional 48 km Nunwan-
Pahalgam route in Anantnag
and the 14 km shorter but
steeper Baltal route in

Ganderbal on July 3.A day
earlier, the first batch of pil-
grims will leave Jammu's
Bhagwati nagar base camp
and Ram Mandir for the
Valley. The shrine houses the
naturally formed ice
Shivlingam and over 5.10
lakh pilgrims paid their obei-
sance at the 3,880-meter-high
shrine last year. "The sadhus
have started arriving in
Jammu city. Scores have
reached our temple complex,
which is one of the boarding

and lodging centres for the
Sadhus," said temple head
Mahant Rameshwar Dass.

The famous Ram Mandir
in the old city reverberates
with chants in praise of
Lord Shiva, as over 200 sad-
hus from across the country
have reached here to take
part in the annual yatra to
the holy cave shrine of
Amarnath. "All necessary
arrangements, including
round-the-clock free 
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In a significant move
aimed at accelerating the
developmental momentum
and catalysing key sectoral

reforms, Chief Secretary,
Atal Dulloo, today chaired a
high-level meeting to discuss
the adoption and implemen-
tation of Government of
India's transformative

scheme, Special Assistance
to States for Capital
Investment (SASCI).
Launched by the
Government of India in 
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SASCI to give huge push to key 
infrastructure development in J&K: CS

DGCA orders enhanced
inspection of Air India's

Boeing 787 Dreamliner fleet
NEW DELHI, JUN 13:

Aviation watchdog DGCA
on Friday ordered enhanced
safety inspection of Air
India's Boeing 787
Dreamliner fleet powered by
GEnx engines, a day after
241 people onboard died in
the plane crash in
Ahmedabad. The enhanced
DGCA inspection will
include checks of various
systems and a review of 
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National Conference (NC)
Lok Sabha MP Aga Syed
Ruhullah Mehdi on Friday
said Israel is behaving like a
"colonial thug" by attacking
sovereign nations at
will."Israel has now bombed
Palestine, Yemen, Syria,
Lebanon and Iran, and still
plays the victim. This rogue
Zionist regime isn't defend-
ing itself, it's behaving like a

colonial thug," Mehdi said in
a post on X.The influential
Shia leader said attacking
sovereign nations at will
"does not make you power-
ful, it makes you a terrorist
state". Mehdi, the Lok Sabha
MP from Srinagar, said Iran,
like any sovereign nation,
now has every right to defend
itself and "take full, punish-
ing revenge". "The Zionist
regime should pay for its
crimes in Gaza, for its blood-

lust, for its massacres,"
Mehdi said in the post.In
another post on X, Mehdi
said India's abstention in the
UN General Assembly from
a vote on a draft resolution
that demanded "immediate,
unconditional and perma-
nent" ceasefire in Gaza
reflects "shrinking of moral
imagination". "India once
stood tall among the post-
colonial nations, defending 
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Israel behaving like colonial thug by attacking
sovereign nations at will: Ruhullah Mehdi
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Safety, mission integrity top 
priority, says ISRO amid Axiom-4 delay;

Musk raises ISS safety concern
NEW DELHI, JUN 13:

ISRO on Friday asserted
that safety and mission
integrity were its top priority
as NASA and Axiom Space
said they were working to
address an issue related to a
leak at the International
Space Station, even as
SpaceX chief Elon Musk
voiced concerns over the
long-term safety of the
orbital lab and suggested it
be brought down in two
years. India's Shubhanshu 
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IAF Apache Helicopter
makes 'precautionary
landing' in Pathankot

NEW DELHI, JUN 13:
An Apache attack helicop-

ter of the Indian Air Force
(IAF) made a "precautionary
landing" in Punjab's
Pathankot district while on a

(Cont. on P-8 )

India's forex 
reserves jump USD 5.17

bn to USD 696.65 bn
MUMBAI, JUN 13:

India's forex reserves
increased by USD 5.17 bil-
lion to USD 696.65 billion
for the week ended June 6,
the RBI said on Friday. 

(Cont. on P-8 )

AI plane crash: Black box 
recovered from rooftop of BJ Medical

College's residential quarters
AHMEDABAD, JUN 13:

Aircraft Accident
Investigation Bureau
(AAIB) on Friday said the
black box of Air India's
crashed Boeing 787
Dreamliner aircraft has been
recovered from the rooftop 
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Israel-Iran tensions: Puri
says India has adequate

energy supplies
NEW DELHI, JUN 13:

India, the world's third-
largest oil importer and
fourth biggest gas buyer, has
enough energy supplies for
the coming months, Oil
Minister Hardeep Singh Puri
said amid escalating tensions
in the globe's biggest energy
supply regions. 
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The Lieutenant Governor
Shri Manoj Sinha today
chaired a high-level meeting
with senior officials to
review the security arrange-
ments for the forthcoming
Shri Amarnath Ji Yatra. The
meeting was attended by Shri
Atal Dulloo, Chief Secretary;
Shri Nalin Prabhat, DGP
J&K; Lt Gen Prashant

Srivastava, GoC 15 Corps;
Shri S.J.M Gillani, Special
Director General
(Coordination), PHQ; Shri
Pankaj Thakur, Joint Director
IB; Shri Nitish Kumar,
ADGP CID J&K; Shri
Rajesh Kumar, ADG CRPF;
Dr Mandeep K. Bhandari,
CEO SABS and Principal
Secretary to Lieutenant
Governor; Shri Ramesh
Kumar, Divisional

Commissioner Jammu; Shri
Vijay Kumar Bidhuri,
Divisional Commissioner
Kashmir; Shri VK Birdi, IGP
Kashmir; Shri Bhim Sen
Tuti, IGP Jammu; senior offi-
cials of Police, Army, CAPFs
and Intelligence Agencies.

The Lieutenant Governor
took a comprehensive review
of the security apparatus and
measures deployed by the
security agencies to ensure

safety of the pilgrims.He
directed for seamless coordi-
nation among the Civil
Administration, Shri
Amarnath Ji Shrine Board,
J&K Police, Army, Security
Forces, and all the other cru-
cial stakeholders to ensure a
peaceful and successful holy
pilgrimage. The Lieutenant
Governor reviewed the work-
ing of the security grid and 
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Lieutenant Governor chairs high-level security
review meeting for Shri Amarnath Ji Yatra

CM listens to several delegations during his 
Raabita programme, attends to grievances firsthand

AHMEDABAD, JUN 13:
Prime Minister Narendra

Modi on Friday visited the
site of the Air India plane
crash, in which 265 people
lost their lives, and met the
injured at the civil hospital in
Ahmedabad.A day after the
deadly plane crash in the city,
the bodies of six victims

were handed over to their
families after identification
on Friday, police said. In
case of the other bodies,
which are partially or fully
charred, it will take around
72 hours to complete the
exercise of matching their
DNA samples, police said.

(Cont. on P-8 )

NEW DELHI, JUN 13:
Strategically located to

address regional disparities,
every AIIMS serves as a cen-
tre of healthcare innovation
and learning, delivering
equitable, affordable and evi-
dence-based healthcare serv-
ices, Union Health minister J
P Nadda said on

Friday.These institutions
reflect the government's
commitment to strengthen
public health systems, rais-
ing standards of care and
nurturing a new generation
of healthcare leaders, he
said.Nadda made the
remarks while virtually 

(Cont. on P-8 )

Amarnath Yatra: Sadhus reach Jammu ahead
of commencement of pilgrimage on July 3

PM Modi meets injured in AI plane crash;
six of 265 bodies handed over to kin

Every AIIMS serves as centre of 
healthcare innovation, learning: Nadda

Ahmedabad plane crash
lone survivor can't

believe how he survived
AHMEDABAD, JUN 13:

Vishwas Kumar Ramesh,
the sole survivor of Air
India's AI 171 crash, said he
still cannot believe how he
miraculously survived the
accident of the ill-fated
London-bound flight in 
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India, China agree to 
expedite steps involved in

resuming direct air services
NEW DELHI, JUN 13:

Foreign Secretary Vikram
Misri held talks with
Chinese Vice Foreign
Minister Sun Weidong dur-
ing which the two sides
reviewed the developments
in India-China bilateral 
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UT eligible to secure thousands of crores as interest-free loan under this scheme


